Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Young Environmental Consulting Group LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

112 East 5th Street Suite 102
Chaska, MN 55318
Linda Loomis

P.O. Box 43933

Minneapolis, MN 55443

(651)249-6974

Invoice number 180133
Date 06/07/2024

Project Spring Creek Sites 1 & 2 Designh &
Construction Stabilization Project

Task 1-1 Project Management
Professional Fees

Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 3.25 125.00 406.25
Task 3-3 Permitting
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Christopher Ross
Analyst 2 0.50 125.00 62.50
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 3.50 125.00 437.50
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 9.00 115.00 1,035.00
Phase subtotal 1,535.00
Task 3-5 Coordination with Project Partners
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 0.50 125.00 62.50
Invoice total 2,003.75
Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180133 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180133
Project Spring Creek Sites 1 & 2 Design & Construction Stabilization Project Date 06/07/2024

Approved by:

Della N. Young
Founder/CEO

Thank you for your business & prompt payment. Professional services through 05/31/2024

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180133 Invoice date 06/07/2024
Page 2 of 2



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Young Environmental Consulting Group LLC
P.O. Box 43933
Minneapolis, MN 55443
(651)249-6974

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180134

112 East 5th Street Suite 102 Date 06/07/2024
Chaska, MN 55318

Linda Loomis Project MN River Floodplain Modeling

Task 1-1 Project Plan Development and Project Management
Professional Fees

Billed
Hours Rate Amount

Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 2.00 125.00 250.00
Task 2-2 Gather Development Information
Professional Fees

Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 2.50 115.00 287.50
Task 4-1 Update Hydraulic Model Geometry
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 5.00 125.00 625.00
Invoice total 1,162.50
Approved by:
Della N. Young
Founder/CEO
Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180134 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental

Consulting Group, LLC
Invoice number 180134

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District
Project MN River Floodplain Modeling Date 06/07/2024

Thank you for your business and prompt payment. Professional services through 05/31/2024.

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180134 Invoice date 06/07/2024
Page 2 of 2



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Young Environmental Consulting Group LLC
P.O. Box 43933
Minneapolis, MN 55443
(651)249-6974

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180135

112 East 5th Street Suite 102 Date 06/07/2024
Chaska, MN 55318

Linda Loomis Project Dredge Management Site 2022

Task 2 - Coordination
Professional Fees

Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 2.00 125.00 250.00
Invoice total 250.00
Approved by:
Della N. Young
Founder/CEO
Thank you for your business & prompt payment. Professional services through 05/31/2024
Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180135 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Young Environmental Consulting Group LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

112 East 5th Street Suite 102
Chaska, MN 55318
Linda Loomis

P.O. Box 43933

Minneapolis, MN 55443

(651)249-6974

Invoice number
Date

180136
06/07/2024

Project Fen Stewardship Program-2024

Task 1.1 Plan Development & Project Mgmt
Professional Fees

Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr

Jennifer Mocol-Johnson
Program/Sr. Project Manager

Task 1.3 MnDNR Coordination
Professional Fees

Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr
Task 2.1 Recharge Area Mapping
Professional Fees

Christopher Ross
Analyst 2

Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr

Jim Berg
Scientist 2

Task 3.1 Implementation of Stewardship Strategies

Professional Fees

Christopher Ross
Analyst 2

Billed

Hours Rate Amount

4.25 164.00 697.00

0.25 170.00 42.50

Phase subtotal 739.50
Billed

Hours Rate Amount

1.00 164.00 164.00

Billed

Hours Rate Amount

0.75 133.00 99.75

1.00 164.00 164.00

3.00 140.00 420.00

Phase subtotal 683.75
Billed

Hours Rate Amount

2.75 133.00 365.75

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180136

Invoice date 06/07/2024
Page 1 of 2



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180136
Project Fen Stewardship Program-2024 Date 06/07/2024
Task 3.1 Implementation of Stewardship Strategies
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr 20.75 164.00 3,403.00
Erica E. Bock
Scientist 1 1.50 80.00 120.00
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 32.00 115.00 3,680.00
Lan H. Tornes
Scientist 2 5.50 90.00 495.00
Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Office Expense 32.55
Phase subtotal 8,096.30
Task 4.0 Seminary Fen Stewardship Plan Implementation
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Lan H. Tornes
Scientist 2 1.70 90.00 153.00
Invoice total 9,836.55

Approved by:

Della N. Young
Founder/CEO

Thank you for your business & prompt payment. Professional services through 05/31/2024

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180136

Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Young Environmental Consulting Group LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District
112 East 5th Street Suite 102

Chaska, MN 55318

Linda Loomis

P.O. Box 43933
Minneapolis, MN 55443
(651)249-6974

Invoice number
Date

180137
06/07/2024

Project Trout Stream Geomorphic Assessment

1.1 Plan Development & Project Mgmt
Professional Fees

Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr

Jennifer Mocol-Johnson
Program/Sr. Project Manager

2.2 Survey Method Development
Professional Fees

Christopher Ross
Analyst 2
3.1 Review Background Information
Professional Fees

Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr
3.2 Project Partner Coordination
Professional Fees

Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr
3.3 Initial Field Condition Assessment
Professional Fees

Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr

Billed

Hours Rate Amount
6.25 164.00 1,025.00
0.25 170.00 42.50
Phase subtotal 1,067.50
Billed

Hours Rate Amount
4.00 133.00 532.00
Billed

Hours Rate Amount
1.75 164.00 287.00
Billed

Hours Rate Amount
2.50 164.00 410.00
Billed

Hours Rate Amount
7.25 164.00 1,189.00

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180137

Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180137
Project Trout Stream Geomorphic Assessment Date 06/07/2024
3.3 Initial Field Condition Assessment
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 10.00 129.00 1,290.00
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 2.50 115.00 287.50
Phase subtotal 2,766.50
4.1 Collect Survey Data
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Ashley Weihs
Intern 33.75 68.00 2,295.00
Christopher Ross
Analyst 2 3.00 133.00 399.00
Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr 22.75 164.00 3,731.00
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 4.75 129.00 612.75
Josephine Khan
Intern 33.75 68.00 2,295.00
Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Subscriptions 1.00 493.79 493.79
Phase subtotal 9,826.54
4.2 Geomorphic Assessment
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Ashley Weihs
Intern 19.50 68.00 1,326.00
Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr 5.00 164.00 820.00
Josephine Khan
Intern 19.50 68.00 1,326.00
Phase subtotal 3,472.00
4.3 Fish Passage Evaluation
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Ashley Weihs
Intern 4.00 68.00 272.00

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180137

Invoice date 06/07/2024
Page 2 of 3



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180137
Project Trout Stream Geomorphic Assessment Date 06/07/2024
4.3 Fish Passage Evaluation
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr 3.00 164.00 492.00
Josephine Khan
Intern 4.00 68.00 272.00
Phase subtotal 1,036.00
4.4 Assumption Creek, Eagle Creek & Unnamed Stream 1 Assessment
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Ashley Weihs
Intern 4.00 68.00 272.00
Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr 6.50 164.00 1,066.00
Josephine Khan
Intern 4.00 68.00 272.00
Phase subtotal 1,610.00
Invoice total 21,007.54
Approved by:
Della N. Young
Founder/CEO
Professional services through 05/31/2024
Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180137 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

112 East 5th Street Suite 102
Chaska, MN 55318
Linda Loomis

Young Environmental Consulting Group LLC

P.O. Box 43933

Minneapolis, MN 55443

(651)249-6974

Invoice number 180138
Date 06/07/2024

Project Education and Outreach

1.1 Project Plan Development and Project Mgmt

Professional Fees

Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jennifer Mocol-Johnson
Program/Sr. Project Manager 0.25 170.00 42.50
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 1.50 115.00 172.50
Susan A. Lindberg
Comm Manager 2.50 136.00 340.00
Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Document Review/Proofreading 1.00 139.83 139.83
Phase subtotal 694.83
2.1 Maintain & Retain CAC Members
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 4.50 115.00 517.50
Rachel Kapsch
Scientist 1 1.50 77.00 115.50
Susan A. Lindberg
Comm Manager 1.50 136.00 204.00
Phase subtotal 837.00
2.2 Plan & Facilitate CAC Meetings
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 4.00 115.00 460.00
Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138
Project Education and Outreach Date 06/07/2024
2.3 Monitor & Assist the CAC
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 2.50 115.00 287.50
Rachel Kapsch
Scientist 1 3.00 77.00 231.00
Phase subtotal 518.50
2.4 Develop CAC Materials
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 6.50 115.00 747.50
Rachel Kapsch
Scientist 1 2.50 77.00 192.50
Phase subtotal 940.00
3.1 Maintain Social Media Sites
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 2.75 115.00 316.25
Rachel Kapsch
Scientist 1 0.25 77.00 19.25
Phase subtotal 335.50
3.2 Enhance Social Media Messaging
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 2.00 115.00 230.00
Susan A. Lindberg
Comm Manager 1.00 136.00 136.00
Phase subtotal 366.00
3.3 Grow Social Media Following
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 4.00 115.00 460.00
Rachel Kapsch
Scientist 1 1.75 77.00 134.75
Phase subtotal 594.75

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180138

Invoice date 06/07/2024
Page 2 of 4



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138
Project Education and Outreach Date 06/07/2024
4.1 Interpretive Signage
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 2.00 115.00 230.00
Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Miles 52.20 0.585 30.54
Phase subtotal 260.54
4.2 Resource ID & Protection Signs
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 4.75 115.00 546.25
5.2 Grant Program
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 1.00 115.00 115.00
6.1 Partnership
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 6.00 115.00 690.00
6.2 Local Events
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 9.00 115.00 1,035.00
Rachel Kapsch
Scientist 1 0.25 77.00 19.25
Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Miles 36.00 0.585 21.06
Phase subtotal 1,075.31

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180138

Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138
Project Education and Outreach Date 06/07/2024
6.3 Tabling Materials
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 3.50 115.00 402.50
Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Office Expense 70.00
Copiess 44.88
Phase subtotal 517.38
Invoice total 7,951.06
Approved by:
Della N. Young
Founder/CEO
Thank you for your business & prompt payment. Professional services through 05/31/2024
Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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F

April 10, 2024
Dear Young Environmental,

Please save or print this page for your records.You will receive an e-mail to download your document when it has
been completed. Be sure to add order@proofreadingpal.com to your safe senders list to ensure proper
delivery of future e-mails from ProofreadingPal.com.

You can check the status of your document by visiting our document status and download page.
If you have further questions about your order please feel free to contact us.

ProofreadingPal LLC
105 lowa Ave.

Ste. 214

lowa City, IA 52240

Phone: 888-833-8385
E-mail: contact@proofreadingpal.com

Personal Information

Name: Young Environmental
E-mail: della@youn: .com
6040 Earle Brown Drive, Suite 306

Address: Brooklyn Center, MN 55430
United States

Order/Billing Summary:
File Name: LMRWDQtr1ProgRepApr2024-v1.docx
Project ID: 160535

6 hour turnaround

Turnaround Speed: Two Proofreaders

Number of Words: 2370
Total: $139.83
Points and rewards: You earned 1398 points
Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180138

Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Office pEPOT
OfficeMax
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SALE E641-2-7963-287328-24.1.1
334951 BOARD FOAM, 405 13,7855
E4B8E37 CLUESTICK,22G 3.35 &8
Subtotal: 25318
Local Sales and Usae T 1.94
Total: 25.12
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TDS Chip Read
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Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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TDS Chip Read
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Shop online at www.officedepot.com

WE WANT TO HEAR FROM YOLI!
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Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138 Invoice date 06/07/2024



Office pEPOT
OfficeMax

SAINT LOUIS PARK -{952) 417-0755
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Total: 44.88
MasterCard 2419: 44,88

AUTH CODE 60129P

TDS Chip Read

AID AQODOCOQD41010 Mastercard
CVS Mo Signature Reguired

Shop online at www.officedepot.com

WE WANT TO HEAR FROM YOLI!
Visit survey.officedepot.com
and enter the survey code below
16VB 51CQ EDOT
or scan the below QR code

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180138 Invoice date 06/07/2024



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Young Environmental Consulting Group LLC
P.O. Box 43933
Minneapolis, MN 55443
(651)249-6974

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180139

112 East 5th Street Suite 102 Date 06/07/2024
Chaska, MN 55318

Linda Loomis Project Area 3 Bluff Stabilization-2024

2.2 Permit Apps & Regulatory Agency Coord
Professional Fees

Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Christopher Ross
Analyst 2 1.00 125.00 125.00
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 2.25 125.00 281.25
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 0.50 115.00 57.50
Phase subtotal 463.75
Invoice total 463.75
Approved by:
Della N. Young
Founder/CEO
Thank you for your business & prompt payment. Professional services through 05/31/2024
Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180139 Invoice date 06/07/2024
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Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District
112 East 5th Street Suite 102

Chaska, MN 55318
Linda Loomis

Young Environmental Consulting Group LLC

P.O. Box 43933

Minneapolis, MN 55443

(651)249-6974

Invoice number
Date

180140
06/07/2024

Project General Engineering-2024

Task 1: On Call
Professional Fees

Christopher Ross
Analyst 2

Della N. Young
Principal

Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr

Erica E. Bock
Scientist 1

Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer

Jess Norby
Scientist 2

Lan H. Tornes
Scientist 2

Susan A. Lindberg
Comm Manager

Reimbursables

Document Review/Proofreading

Task 3: Project Reviews
Professional Fees

Ashley Weihs
Intern

Billed

Hours Rate Amount
1.00 133.00 133.00
21.00 169.00 3,549.00
11.50 164.00 1,886.00
1.50 80.00 120.00
3.25 129.00 419.25
18.00 115.00 2,070.00
1.70 90.00 153.00
7.75 136.00 1,054.00
Billed

Units Rate Amount
1.00 60.99 60.99
Phase subtotal 9,445.24
Billed

Hours Rate Amount
3.00 68.00 204.00

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180140

Invoice date 06/07/2024
Page 1 of 3



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180140
Project General Engineering-2024 Date 06/07/2024
Task 3: Project Reviews
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Christopher Ross
Analyst 2 6.50 133.00 864.50
Derek B. Beauduy
Sr. Scientist - Mgr 5.50 164.00 902.00
Erica E. Bock
Scientist 1 55.75 80.00 4,460.00
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 32.25 129.00 4,160.25
Josephine Khan
Intern 3.00 68.00 204.00
Rachel Kapsch
Scientist 1 36.00 77.00 2,772.00
Susan A. Lindberg
Comm Manager 1.00 136.00 136.00
Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Document Review/Proofreading 1.00 0.0001 0.00
Phase subtotal 13,702.75
Task 7: Project Inspections
Professional Fees
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Christopher Ross
Analyst 2 4.50 133.00 598.50
Erica E. Bock
Scientist 1 22.50 80.00 1,800.00
Hannah R. LeClaire
PM - Engineer 4.50 129.00 580.50
Jess Norby
Scientist 2 4.00 115.00 460.00
Rachel Kapsch
Scientist 1 13.50 77.00 1,039.50
Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Miles 31.90 0.585 18.66
Phase subtotal 4,497.16
Invoice total 27,645.15

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180140

Invoice date 06/07/2024

Page 2 of 3



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District
Project General Engineering-2024

Invoice number 180140

Date

06/07/2024

Approved by:

Della N. Young
Founder/CEO

Thank you for your business & prompt payment. Professional services through 05/31/2024

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District

Invoice number 180140

Invoice date 06/07/2024
Page 3 of 3



ProofreadingPal

May 01, 2024
Dear Suzy Lindberg,

Please save or print this page for your records.You will receive an e-mail to download your document when it has
been completed. Be sure to add order@proofreadingpal.com to your safe senders list to ensure proper
delivery of future e-mails from ProofreadingPal.com.

You can check the status of your document by visiting our document status and download page.
If you have further questions about your order please feel free to contact us.

ProofreadingPal LLC
105 lowa Ave.

Ste. 214

lowa City, IA 52240

Phone: 888-833-8385
E-mail: contac roofreadingpal.com

Personal Information
Name: Suzy Lindberg
E-mail: oungecg.com
6040 Earle Brown Drive, Suite 306

Address: Brooklyn Center, MN 55430
United States

Order/Billing Summary:
File Name: Education-and-Outreach-Discussion-April-2024_docx
Project ID: 161116

Tumaround Speed: 10 hour turnaround

One Proofreader
Number of Words: 1605
Total: $60.99
Points and rewards: You earned 610 points

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180140 Invoice date 06/07/2024



Young Environmental
Consulting Group, LLC

Memo

To: Linda Loomis, Administrator

From: Della Schall Young, Principal Scientist
Date: June 6, 2024

Re:

General Engineering Services

Below is a summary of activities completed May 1 — 31, 2024, to provide services under the
professional engineering services contract.

1. On-Call Services — 65.70 hours
a. Administrator and consultant meetings
b. Monthly Board Meeting
c. Board Workshop
d. RTA Water Resources Restoration Fund
e. Barge Tour Assistance

3. Project Reviews — 143 hours (See Table 1)

7. Project Inspections — 49 hours

a. Finalize best management practices (BMPs) inspection form and process for inspecting
BMPs with LMRWD executed maintenance agreements.

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180140 Invoice date 06/07/2024



May 2024 LMRWD Individual Permit
Project Review Summary

2024 MSP Terminal | Concourse G Infill Pods 2-3 | Permit No. 2024-012

5/28/2024 Email New permit application submitted
5/28/2024 Email Permit applicant provided additional information
5/29/2024 Email LMRWD asked for clarification on the progress and connectivity of previous project in the

proposed location and for project materials to be sent to a different email address

2024 T2 North Expansion | Permit No.2024-006

5/6/2024 Email Permit applicant provided additional information and asked if Rule B and Rule D could be
permitted separately

5/7/2024 Email Permit applicant asked for status on Rule B review and whether Rule B approval would be an
item on the upcoming Board meeting agenda

5/7/2024 Email LMRWD informed applicant that project will not be included on the May Board meeting
agenda

5/10/2024 Email Permit applicant asked for clarification on materials still required

5/10/2024 Email LMRWD provided clarification on required materials

5/13/2024 Email Permit applicant provided updated materials

5/13/2024 Email LMRWD thanked permit applicant for additional materials and asked for an updated
construction schedule

5/13/2024 Email Permit applicant provided adjusted start date for construction

5/17/2024 Email Permit applicant asked for status update on LMRWD review

5/17/2024 Email LMRWD thanked applicant for additional information and reminded them of the business days
allotted for LMRWD to perform review

5/29/2024 Email LMRWD notified permit applicant of their incomplete application and asked for meeting
availability

5/29/2024 Email Kimley-Horn sent meeting availability

5/29/2024 Email MAC representative sent meeting availability

5/29/2024 Email TKDA sent meeting availability

5/29/2024 Email MAC representative sent meeting availability

5/30/2024 Email H+U Construction sent meeting availability

5/30/2024 Email Applicant asked for LMRWD meeting availability in order to send invite

5/30/2024 Email LMRWD responded with meeting availability

5/30/2024 Email Meeting invite received

3rd Street Bridge Replacement | Permit No.2022-042

5/22/2024 Email Permittee provided LMRWD with contractor contact information

5/22/2024 Email Approved project permit sent to applicant. LMRWD informed applicant that inspections will
be completed during the construction season and asked for brief status update
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5250 Eagle Creek Blvd | Permit No.2023-019
5/1/2024 Email LMRWD asked permittee for a project status update

5/21/2024 Email LMRWD asked the City of Shakopee if a follow up was received from the permittee

77th Street Underpass | Permit No. 2020-132

5/1/2024 Email Permittee forwarded project update email

5/1/2024 Meeting Meeting held with permittee

Ace Rent A Car | Permit No.2022-022

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates

5/23/2024 Email LMRWD notified permittee of upcoming inspection

AT&T Bloomington to Eureka Fiber | Permit No.2023-009

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates

5/1/2024 Email Permittee provided project updates and contact information

Building Renovation Park Jeep | Permit No.2021-030
5/23/2024 Email LMRWD notified permittee of upcoming inspection

5/23/2024 Email Permittee notified LMRWD that site will be accessible for inspection

Burnsville Sanitary Landfill | Permit No.2022-040

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates

5/1/2024 Email Permittee provided project updates and contact information

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD thanked permittee for updates and provided information on expitation and permit
renewal

Carmeuse Savage Marine Improvements | Permit No.2023-024
5/13/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of conditional approval

CenterPoint Energy Pipeline Abandonment | Permit No. 2023-026

5/29/2024 Email Permittee sent information on conditional approval items

5/29/2024 Email LMRWD sent project permit

ChaskaTH 41 / CSAH 61 Improvements | Permit No. 2022-014

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates
5/2/2024 Email Permittee provided project updates and contact information
5/2/2024 Email

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District Invoice number 180140 Invoice date 06/07/2024



ChaskaTH 41 / CSAH 61 Improvements | Permit No. 2022-014

LMRWD asked for clarification on completion date included in permittee's project updates
5/2/2024 Email Permittee provided clarification on completion date

5/2/2024 Email LMRWD thanked permittee for clarification

City of Bloomington Storm Sewer Maintenance | Permit No. 2023-015

5/1/2024 Email Permittee sent project completion date

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates
5/1/2024 Email LMRWD requested record drawings and reminded permittee of inspection requirement
5/1/2024 Email Permittee provided additional information and record drawings

5/23/2024 Email LMRWD notified permittee of upcoming inspection

5/24/2024 Email Permittee provided instructions on how to access the site for inspection

Eagle Creek Bridge Slope Stabilization | Permit No.2023-002

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent permit expiration reminder email

Former Knox Site | Permit No.2022-039

5/23/2024 Email LMRWD notified permittee of upcoming inspection
5/23/2024 Email Permittee notified LMRWD of the site's restricted access and how to access the site
5/23/2024 Email LMRWD thanked permittee for response

Fort Snelling Redevelopment | Permit No.2020-113

5/23/2024 Email LMRWD notified permittee of upcoming inspection

5/23/2024 Email Permittee notified LMRWD that site will be accessible for inspection

5/28/2024 Email Permittee informed LMRWD of their attendance at upcoming site inspection

5/28/2024 Email LMRWD notified permittee that they would reach back out with estimated arrival time for
inspection

5/29/2024 Email LMRWD provided estimated arrival time for site inspection

5/29/2024 Email Permittee responded confirming receipt of inspection time

FWTEC Parking Lot Improvements | Permit No.2024-009
5/15/2024 Email Permit applicant provided additional information

5/16/2024 Email LMRWD thanked applicant for additional information and informed applicant of items still
required to complete review

General Permit Question | Permit No.
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General Permit Question | Permit No.

5/1/2024
5/2/2024
5/6/2024
5/6/2024
5/8/2024
5/10/2024
5/29/2024
5/29/2024
5/29/2024
5/30/2024
5/30/2024

5/30/2024

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

MCWD followed up on permit deferral question for MAC De-Icer Storage Facility project

LMRWD confirmed approval of permit deferral and asked for final construction plans and the
executed permit once received

MnDOT representative sent upcoming project information and requested LMRWD send
meeting availability. Project involves performing repair work on Beaver Pond (East Pond)

Stantec representative provided project information and asked for submittal requirements for
permitting their upcoming RTA West Bluff Overlook Stabilization Improvements project

LMRWD sent meeting availability to MnDOT representative

LMRWD provided clarification to Stantec representative on Rule F exemption and potential
requirement for a Rule B permit for their upcoming RTA project

Rehder representative asked for clarification on the permitting authority for their upcoming
project in Burnsville

LMRWD notified Rehder representative that the City of Burnsville holds their LGU Permit
and would be the permitting authority for their project

Rehder representative thanked LMRWD for the clarification

Moore Engineering representative asked about stormwater model data availability and LMRWD
review of their upcoming project

LMRWD provided Moore Engineering with information on who to contact for model results
and the applicability of a LMRWD permit. Instructions on how to apply for a LMRWD permit

Moore Engineering thanked LMRWD for information and response

Greenway Bridge | Permit No.2023-010

5/21/2024
5/21/2024
5/21/2024

5/21/2024

Email

Email

Email

Email

New permit application submitted
Permit applicant emailed asking for confirmation of application
Permit applicant followed up and asked LMRWD to disregard previous confirmation request

LMRWD thanked applicant for materials and notified them of review process

Ivy Brook Parking Northeast | Permit No.2022-027

5/1/2024
5/1/2024
5/1/2024
5/23/2024

5/23/2024

Email

Email

Email

Email

Email

Permittee provided photos of site conditions and asked about permit closure

LMRWD thanked permittee for photos and reminded permittee of inspection requitement
Permittee thanked LMRWD for the update

LMRWD notified permittee of upcoming inspection

Permittee notified LMRWD that site will be accessible for inspection

KTI Fencing Property | Permit No.2023-014

5/1/2024
5/1/2024

5/1/2024

Email

Email

Email

LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates
Permittee provided project updates and contact information

LMRWD thanked permittee for as-built survey
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Lakota Lane | Permit No.2023-001

5/2/2024 Email LMRWD notified applicant that an after-the-fact permit is required
5/8/2024 Email Permit applicant provided additional information

5/13/2024 Email Permit applicant asked if LMRWD requited any other information/materials
5/29/2024 Email LMRWD requested model results

5/30/2024 Email Permit applicant provided model results

Lower Lyndale Road and Parking Lot | Permit No.2024-010

5/1/2024 Email Applicant asked for clarification on model requiring revisions

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent model requiring revision

5/3/2024 Phone call ~ LMRWD administrator held meeting with permit applicant

5/3/2024 Email LMRWD administrator followed up meeting with question for permitting staff on approval
timeline

5/7/2024 Email Permit applicant followed up on LMRWD email that was quarantined by a spam folder and
asked LMRWD to resend

5/7/2024 Email LMRWD sent files and asked for confirmation of receipt

5/7/2024 Email Permit applicant confirmed receiving materials

5/7/2024 Email LMRWD informed applicant of incomplete permit application

5/7/2024 Email Permit applicant confirmed that changes will be made and materials returned to LMRWD

5/17/2024 Email Permit applicant provided additional information

5/20/2024 Email LMRWD thanked permit applicant for additional information

5/21/2024 Email Permit applicant followed up asking if any additional materials are required for project to be
eligible for June Board meeting

5/22/2024 Email LMRWD informed permit applicant that submitted matetials are under review

5/28/2024 Email LMRWD asked for updated No-Rise certification and for clarification on the construction
sequence

5/28/2024 Email Permit applicant provided updated No-Rise certification and clarification on location of
erosion control notes

5/29/2024 Email LMRWD notified permit applicant that their project will be on the upcoming Board meeting
agenda

MAC LGU Permit | Permit No.2024-M-02

5/30/2024 Email LGU permit application submitted

5/30/2024 Email LGU permit applicant followed up on application submittal

Merriam Junction Trail | Permit No.2023-013

5/8/2024 Email Permit applicant asked for review status update and receipt of materials

5/8/2024 Email
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Merriam Junction Trail | Permit No.2023-013

LMRWD informed applicant that permit application was under review

5/8/2024 Email Permit applicant thanked LMRWD for update

5/13/2024 Email LMRWD stated that information received was under review

5/17/2024 Email LMRWD thanked applicant for additional information and informed applicant that project
requires permitting under Rule B and Rule C

5/17/2024 Email LMRWD asked applicant to provide their meeting availability

5/17/2024 Email Permit applicant provided meeting availability and comments to discuss with LMRWD

5/20/2024 Email LMRWD thanked permit applicant for sending meeting availability and informed applicant that
they'd send meeting invite

5/21/2024 Email Permit applicant provided additional information

5/21/2024 Email Meeting held with permit applicant

5/22/2024 Email LMRWD informed permit applicant that submitted materials are under review

5/22/2024 Email Permit applicant asked for update by the end of the day regarding project eligibility for the June
Board meeting

5/22/2024 Email LMRWD expressed understood urgency of the project and reminded permit applicant of
review timelines

5/28/2024 Email LMRWD asked for meeting availability

5/28/2024 Email Permit applicant provided meeting availability

5/28/2024 Meeting Meeting held with permit applicant

5/28/2024 Email LMRWD provided list of deliverables required

5/29/2024 Email Permit applicant provided additional information

5/31/2024 Email LMRWD sent receipt of materials to permit applicant

MN Bluffs Regional Trail | Permit No.2023-017
5/9/2024 Email Permit applicant asked for the applicability of Rule C and asked question on City approval

5/13/2024 Email LMRWD provided clarification on Rule C applicability and City approval

MN River Greenway Trail | Permit No.2023-007
5/20/2024 Email LMRWD informed permittee of permit amendment approval

MnDOT Pond Maintenance | Permit No.2024-002
5/20/2024 Email LMRWD informed permit applicant of conditional approval

Opus Marsh | Permit No.2024-01 |
5/10/2024 Email LMRWD asked clarifying question on changes made to floodplain

5/13/2024 Email
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Opus Marsh | Permit No.2024-01 |

5/13/2024 Email

Permit applicant provided additional information on post-project elevations

LMRWD thanked permit applicant for additional information

Organic Recycling Facility Relocation | Permit No.2022-016

5/1/2024 Email
5/2/2024 Email
5/2/2024 Email
5/20/2024 Email
5/20/2024 Email

LMRWD sent permit expiration reminder email

Permittee provided project updates and asked about permit extension expiration
LMRWD provided clarification on permit extension expiration

LMRWD informed permittee of permit renewal and sent renewed permit

Permittee thanked LMRWD

Peterson Wetland Bank | Permit No. 2022-037

5/1/2024 Email
5/1/2024 Email
5/9/2024 Email
5/9/2024 Email

LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates
Permittee provided project updates and contact information
LMRWD informed permittee of permit closure items

Permittee provided additional information about current site conditions

Quarry Lake Playground | Permit No.2023-011

5/23/2024 Email

5/23/2024 Email

LMRWD notified permittee of upcoming inspection

Permittee notified LMRWD that site will be accessible for inspection

Safety and Security Center Phase 2 | Permit No. 2023-022

5/2/2024 Email
5/7/2024 Email
5/10/2024 Email
5/13/2024 Email
5/14/2024 Email
5/17/2024 Email
5/23/2024 Email
5/28/2024 Email

Permit applicant asked for review status update
Permit applicant asked if project would be included on the May Board meeting agenda
LMRWD informed permit applicant that project will be on the upcoming Board meeting

agenda and restated conditional approval items
Permit applicant provided draft maintenance agreement and asked LMRWD to review before

finalizing
LMRWD provided updated draft maintenance agreement
LMRWD informed permit applicant of conditional approval

Permittee sent executed maintenance agreement

LMRWD sent updated project permit

SP 2782-352 35W Resurface and Auxiliary Lane | Permit No.2022-041

5/1/2024 Email

5/10/2024 Email

LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates

Lower Minnesota River Watershed District
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SP 2782-352 35W Resurface and Auxiliary Lane | Permit No.2022-041

Permittee provided project updates

Tarnhill Pond | Permit No.2023-029

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates

5/1/2024 Email Permittee provided project updates and contact information

TH 41 ORF Relocation | Permit No. 2023-027

5/1/2024 Email Applicant provided signed bid plan set

5/1/2024 Meeting Meeting held with permit applicant

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent meeting follow up and informed applicant of items required for LMRWD rule
compliance

5/6/2024 Email LMRWD thanked permit applicant for signed plans and requested a copy of the cooperative
agrecmcnt

5/6/2024 Email Permit applicant updated LMRWD on status of cooperative agreement and asked if
conditional approval could be granted without it

5/7/2024 Email Applicant provided updated HydroCAD output and impervious breakdown map

5/13/2024 Email Permit applicant provided additional information on cooperative agreement and maintenance

5/22/2024 Email Permit applicant asked for confirmation on grading approval and eligibility for June Board
meeting

5/22/2024 Email LMRWD provided clarification on project not being on previous Board meeting agenda and
review timelines

5/27/2024 Email Permit applicant asked for clarification on Rule B approval and June Board meeting date

5/28/2024 Email LMRWD notified permit applicant that their project will be on the upcoming Board meeting
agenda

5/28/2024 Email Permit applicant thanked LMRWD for the update

TH494 SP 2785-433 | Permit No. 2022-019
5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates

5/3/2024 Email Permittee provided project updates and contact information

Tramore Heights Addition | Permit No.2023-020

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of documentation required for permit issuance
5/1/2024 Email Applicant provided status update

5/2/2024 Email Applicant provided City approval and signed maintenance agreement
5/2/2024 Email LMRWD sent approved project permit to applicant

Whispering Waters | Permit No.2021-016

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent permit expiration reminder email and asked for project updates

5/20/2024 Email
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Whispering Waters | Permit No.2021-016

LMRWD asked the City of Shakopee for status update on pond maintenance
5/20/2024 Email The City of Shakopee notified LMRWD that they'd contact the developer and follow up

5/21/2024 Email LMRWD thanked the City of Shakopee for the update

Xcel Driveway | Permit No.2022-015

5/1/2024 Email LMRWD sent reminder of inspection and asked for project and contact updates

5/1/2024 Email Permittee provided project updates and contact information
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